
  
 
 
 
 
I decided to study at the University of Applied Science 
Stralsund, because …  
 
I had the possibility to get to know my professors, sit in small 
classes, enjoy a good studying atmosphere and create the 
procedure of my Bachelor degree course in a way that I 
would have never been able to at other universities.  
The university really gives some freedom to its students that 
I highly appreciate and I am thankful of. I, for example, was 
able to take two semesters abroad and now I’m heading 
towards my third one at the University of Oxford. This is going 
to be the last – but I’m lucky to enjoy the international 
approach of my University. 
 
 
I study Baltic Management Studies, because …  
 
it is, first of all, fully taught in English and gives the 
opportunity to study many other different languages such as 
Norwegian, or Russian. Moreover, I enjoyed the diversity of 
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different cultures and nationalities. Apart from that, some 
professors really inspired me to pursue a career in finance by 
their motivational way of teaching. It is a good course to start 
off an international career if you are really willing to do so.   
 
I especially like the flexibility of professors and the study 
course in general. It allowed me to make choices that would 
not have been possible at other universities. 
 
 
 
The Hanseatic Town of Stralsund as a place of  
study is … 
 
great if you like a student atmosphere where you get to know 
a lot of people that you meet regularly. Compared to bigger 
cities, in which you usually get to know very few people, the 
advantage of Stralsund is that it really becomes a big family 
that you familiarize with very well after a while.  
 
 
 
After my graduation … 
 
I am willing to do a Master degree in Finance somewhere in 
Europe. I already specialized in finance, doing my internship 
right now in Frankfurt in an Asset Management company and 
I fancy in taking a job in that industry. 
 

 
* New name since winter semester 2017/2018: 
“International Management Studies in the Baltic Sea Region 
(BMS)” 
 
 
Do you have questions? 
Studienguide@hochschule-stralsund.de 
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